
FOREST (DECLARATION OF FOREST RESERVES) ORDER 

(under section 4) 

(24th May, 1968) 

ARRANGEMENT OF PARAGRAPHS 

PARAGRAPH 

  

 1.Citation 

 2.Declaration of forest reserves 

  

Schedule - Kasane Forest Reserve 

  

S.I. 42, 1968, 

S.I. 106, 1981, 

S.I. 11, 1987. 

1. Citation 

This Order may be cited as the Forest (Declaration of Forest Reserves) Order. 

2. Declaration of forest reserves 

Every area specified in the Schedule to this Order is hereby declared to be a forest reserve 

with the name specified therein under which the description of the area appears. 

SCHEDULE 
KASANE FOREST RESERVE 

 Commencing at beacon FR.1 which is situated on the eastern side of firebreak No. 0 where the 
Kazungula-Victoria Falls road meets the said firebreak and which beacon bears 220,5° true and 

128,5 metres from Botswana-Zimbabwe boundary beacon No. 834, the boundary of the Forest 
Reserve runs along the western edge of firebreak No. 0 in a generally south-southwesterly 
direction for a distance of approximately 7,7 km to beacon FR.2 situated where firebreak No. 0 
meets the northern edge of the 1967 Kasane-Ngwezumba Bridge road; thence across the said road 
to beacon FR.3 situated on the southern edge thereof; thence along the western edge of the said 
road in a generally southerly direction for a distance of approximately 4,1 km to beacon FR.4 
situated where the said road is joined by the 1967 road to Lesomo; thence in a generally southerly 

direction along the western edge of the said road through beacon FR.5, 84,7 metres from beacon 
FR.4 and situated on the north side of the old road from Serondela to Lesomo (now firebreak No. 
10), and on to beacon FR.6 on the south side of the said road; thence along the western edge of 
the Kasane-Ngwezumba Bridge road in a generally southwesterly direction for a distance of 
approximately 4,3 km to beacon FR.7 situated where the said road meets the northern edge of 
firebreak No. 17; thence to beacon FR.8 situated on the south side of firebreak No. 17; thence 

along the southern edge of firebreak of No. 17 in a generally westerly and northwesterly direction 
for a distance of approximately 6,5 km to beacon FR.9 situated on the southern side of firebreak 



No. 17; thence across firebreak No. 17 for a distance of 8,5 metres to beacon FR.10 situated at the 
point where firebreaks Nos. 17 and 8 meet; thence along the southern edge of firebreak No. 8 in a 
generally northwesterly and northerly direction for a distance of approximately 4,6 km to beacon 
No. FR.11 situated on the southern side of firebreak No. 8 at the point where it is met by firebreak 
No. 10; thence across firebreak No. 10 for a distance of 6,1 metres to beacon No. FR.12 situated 

on the northern side of firebreak No. 10; thence continuing along the southern edge of firebreak 
No. 8 in a generally northwesterly direction for a distance of approximately 2,5 km to beacon FR.13 
situated where firebreaks Nos. 8 and 6 meet; thence across firebreak No. 6 for a distance of 8,2 
metres to beacon FR.14; thence in a northeasterly direction for a distance of 2,1 km along the 
northern edge of firebreak No. 6 to beacon FR.15 situated where firebreaks Nos. 6 and 7 meet; 
thence in a generally northwesterly direction for a distance of approximately 1,9 km along the 
southern edge of firebreak No. 7 to beacon FR.16 situated where firebreaks Nos. 7 and 2 meet; 

thence across firebreak No. 2 for a distance of 8,2 metres to beacon FR.18 situated on the northern 
side of firebreak No. 2; thence along the northern edge of firebreak No. 2 in a generally north 
northwesterly direction for a distance of approximately 4 km to the point where the northern edge 
of firebreak No. 2 meets the southern edge of firebreak No. 5; thence southwards along the 

southern edge of firebreak No. 5 to a beacon TS3, coordinates Y-16696.59, X-19 69864.10, 
situated at the junction of the said southern edge of firebreak No. 5 with the northern edge of the 

Kazungula-Ngoma Bridge road; thence in a generally northeasterly direction along the north edge 
of the said Kazungula-Ngoma Bridge road, to a beacon TS2, coordinates Y-18002.00, X-
1968518.54, situated at the junction of the northern edge of the Kazungula-Ngoma Bridge road 
with the northern edge of firebreak No. 2; thence in an easterly direction along the northern edge 
of the said firebreak No. 2 to a beacon FR.23 coordinates Y-19349.34, X-1968 065.96; thence 
along the northern edge of firebreak No. 2 in a generally southeasterly and easterly direction for a 
distance of approximately 5,4 km to beacon FR.25; thence across firebreak No. 2 for 15,8 metres 

to beacon No. FR.26; thence along the western edge of firebreak No. 1 in a generally southerly 
direction for a distance of approximately 1,2 km to beacon FR.27; thence across firebreak No. 1a 
for a distance of 5,8 metres to beacon FR.28; thence along the northern edge of firebreak No. 1 in 
a generally easterly, southeasterly, northeasterly and easterly direction for a distance of 
approximately 2,7 km to beacon FR.29; thence across firebreak No. 1 for a distance of 6,4 metres 
to beacon FR.30; thence along the southern edge of the 1967 Kazungula-Victoria Falls road in a 

generally easterly direction for a distance of approximately 1,7 km to the point of commencement 

as shown on Plan No. RO-36b deposited with the Director of Surveys and Lands, Gaborone. 
Coordinates are in metres on Trigonometrical System Lo 25. 

2.Area of State land declared forest reserves- 

 (a)Kasane Forest Reserve Extension; 

 (b)Kazuma Forest Reserve; 

 (c)Maikaelelo Forest Reserve; 

 (d)Sibuyu Forest Reserve. 

The boundaries of these forest reserves are delineated on Plan BP-105 deposited with the Director 
of Surveys and Lands, Gaborone. 

3.Chobe Forest Reserve- 

 An area of land within the area of the Chobe Land Board the boundaries of which are delineated 

on Plan BP-105 deposited with the Director of Surveys and Land, Gaborone. 

 


